
TEACH IN
THE       OF
ALASKA

CONTACT US
Dianna Schollmeier
Southwest Region School District
546 Kenny Wren Rd, Dillingham, AK
 dschollmeier@swrsd.org       907-842-8210
www.swrsd.com/tutoring

Robyn Chaney
Dillingham City School District
565 Seward St, Dillingham, AK
rchaney@dlgsd.org                  907-842-6779      
www.dlgsd.org

Four Month

Paid Internship!

January - April 2021

Dianna Schollmeier

Dianna Schollmeier

Dianna Schollmeier
January 2nd to May 2nd
	         2022



YOUR
ALASKAN
ADVENTURE
STARTS HERE!
Southwest Region and Dillingham City School
Districts have partnered to recruit quality mid-
year certified teacher graduates for Academic
Interventionist internships.  Join a cohort of
teachers providing math and reading
intervention in rural Alaskan schools.  See the
wild beauty of Alaska and meet the First
Peoples of the Bristol Bay Region in this
immersive Alaskan experience!

TRAVEL & HOUSING PROVIDED

Academic Interventionists are flown from their
home airport to Anchorage, Alaska for
orientation and shopping before continuing on
their way to their assigned school.  Fully
furnished housing is provided, at no cost,
within walking distance to the schools.
Housing includes all kitchenware, bedding,
cooking and cleaning supplies.  Travel home
will be provided at the completion of the
program.

Academic Interventionists are paid $21/hour
and work 37.5 hours per week for the 12 week
program.

SUPPORT NETWORK

After orientation, Interventionists stay in
contact through weekly professional
development meetings and group exchanges. 
 Interventionists are provided RTI/MTSS tool
kits onsite.  Classroom teachers provide
support and guidance for shared students and
strategies. Site Principals develop schedules
and include Interventionists in professional
development opportunities.

SMALL GROUP INSTRUCTION

    
      
     
     

Grow as a teacher.  Grow as a

person!  Experience a great

transition from being in school

to having a classroom of your

own.
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